

HUNT COUNTY BID TABULATION
 FORMAL BID #218-22, VEHICLE TIRES AND TIRE SERVICE
 Effective January 1, 2022 through December 31, 2022

17,181

Product or Service Required	Southern Tire Mart, LLC.	Annual	Brand	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Annual	Brand	Prev Yrs Usage
The following three tire sizes are for police car applications and shall be bid as pursuit rated tires.							
1 P225/60R16 Police Tire V Speed Rated PV41	\$ 82.18	\$ -	Firestone	\$ 110.60	\$ -	Goodyear Eagle	0
2 P235/55R17 Police Tire W Speed Rated 98W	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 128.83	\$ -	Goodyear Eagle	0
3 P225/60R18 Police Tire V Speed Rated 99V	\$ 120.01	\$ 3,000.25	Firestone	\$ 136.60	\$ 3,415.00	Goodyear Eagle	25
4 P265/60R17 Police Tire H Speed Rated	\$ 126.40	\$ 10,364.80	Firestone	\$ 143.28	\$ 11,748.96	Goodyear Eagle	82
The following tires are for passenger car car & pickup applications.							
5 P185/65R15 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 72.88	\$ 364.40	Goodyear Assurance	5
6 P205/60R15 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	0
7 P215/70R15 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 63.06	\$ -	Goodyear Assurance	0
8 P225/70R15 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 109.07	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
9 P235/75R15 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 77.22	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
10 P225/60R16 All Season BSW	\$ 80.18	\$ 481.08	Firestone	\$ 91.71	\$ 550.26	Goodyear Assurance	6
11 P245/75R17 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 106.81	\$ -	Goodyear Adventure	0
12 P265/70R16 Loadrange C M+S	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	0
13 P215/60R17 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 103.57	\$ -	Goodyear Assurance	0
14 P265/70R17 All Season BSW	\$ 130.49	\$ 782.94	Firestone	\$ 120.35	\$ 722.10	Goodyear Wrangler	6
15 P245/60R18 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 132.36	\$ -	Goodyear Assurance	0
16 P235/70R17 All Season BSW	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 122.10	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
17 P245/70R17 All Season BSW	\$ 108.87	\$ 435.48	Firestone	\$ 122.10	\$ 488.40	Goodyear Fortera	4
18 P255/65R17	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 109.29	\$ -	Goodyear Assurance	0
19 P255/70R16	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 113.18	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
20 P205/75R15	\$ 76.90	\$ 153.80	Firestone	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	2
21 P275/60R20	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 117.57	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
22 P255/65R17	\$ 120.27	\$ 721.62	Firestone	\$ 104.00	\$ 624.00	Goodyear Wrangler	6
23 P255/45-20	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 153.59	\$ -	Goodyear Eagle	0
24 P285/40-20	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	0
25 P225/35-20	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	0
26 P245/35-20	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 133.71	\$ -	Goodyear Eagle	0
27 P225/65-17	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 90.72	\$ -	Goodyear Eagle	0
28 P205/75-14	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	0
29 P255/70R17	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 125.53	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0
The following tires are for Light Truck and Trailer Applications.							
30 LT265/70R17 BSW All Season	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 182.81	\$ -	Goodyear Wrangler	0

FILED FOR RECORD
 at 12:30 o'clock P M

DEC 28 2021

By BECKY LANDRUM
 County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.

HUNT COUNTY BID TABULATION
FORMAL BID #218-22, VEHICLE TIRES AND TIRE SERVICE
Effective January 1, 2022 through December 31, 2022

Product or Service Required	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	NO BID	Brand	Annual	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Annual	Brand	Annual	Brand	Prev Yrs Usage
31 L'235/75R15 Loadrange "C" BSW All Season	NO BID	\$	120.06	\$	480.24	NO BID	\$	150.80	\$	497.32	Goodyear Wrangler	0					
32 L'235/65R16 Loadrange "E" BSW M+S	NO BID	\$	120.06	\$	480.24	Firestone	\$	124.33	\$	497.32	Goodyear Wrangler	4					
33 L'245/70R17 Loadrange "E"	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	127.71	\$	-	Goodyear Wrangler	0					
34 L'245/75R16 Loadrange "E" BSW M+S	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	118.90	\$	-	Goodyear Wrangler	0					
35 LT265/70R17 SBR OWL All M+S 10 ply	NO BID	\$	137.56	\$	1,100.48	Firestone	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	8					
36 L'265/75R16 SBR Loadrange "E" All Season	NO BID	\$	116.48	\$	1,048.32	Firestone	\$	120.67	\$	1,086.03	Goodyear Wrangler	9					
37 LT285/75R16 SBR OWL All Season 8 ply	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	Goodyear Wrangler	0					
38 LT285/75R16 SBR OWL All Season 10 ply	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	142.69	\$	-	Goodyear Wrangler	0					
Southern Tire Mart, LLC.																	
39 ST205/90D15	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
40 ST225/75D15	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	98.12	\$	-	Goodyear Endurance	0					
41 205/75R15	NO BID	\$	73.00	\$	438.00	Trail Master	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	6					
42 215/85.16	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
43 235/60R16	NO BID	\$	91.21	\$	182.42	Firestone	\$	94.46	\$	188.92	Goodyear Assurance	2					
44 275/65R20	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	129.11	\$	-	Goodyear Eagle	0					
45 10-16.5	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
46 7.00-15	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
47 7.50-16 TRACTOR	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
48 10.00-16 TRACTOR	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$	-	NO BID	0					
The Following Services may be required.																	
Southern Tire Mart, LLC.																	
49 Fee to Mount Tires (new stems)	NO BID	\$	12.50	\$	2,250.00		\$	42.00	\$	7,560.00	MRT (Med. Radial Truck)	180					
50 Fee to Balance Tires	NO BID	\$	12.50	\$	2,500.00		\$	38.00	\$	7,600.00	MRT (Med. Radial Truck)	200					
51 Fee for Flat Repair	NO BID	\$	15.00	\$	900.00		\$	52.00	\$	3,120.00	MRT (Med. Radial Truck)	60					
52 Fee for tire rotation	NO BID	\$	3.00	\$	36.00	PER TIRE	\$	15.00	\$	180.00	MRT (Med. Radial Truck)	12					
Total Estimated Annual Cost for tires and Service																	
Firm Fixed fee for front end alignment on:																	
(parts extra if required)																	
53 Ford Crown Vic Sedan	NO BID	\$	59.99	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
54 Chevrolet Impala Sedan	NO BID	\$	59.95	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
55 Dodge Charger 2009-2010	NO BID	\$	59.95	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
56 Ford F-150 2wd pick up	NO BID	\$	59.95	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
57 Ford F-250 2wd pick up	NO BID	\$	59.99	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
58 Ford F-350 2wd pick up	NO BID	\$	59.99	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					
59 Ford E-350 Van	NO BID	\$	59.99	\$	-		\$	-	\$	-	NO BID	0					

